

05/17/2023

Wright, Lindsey & Jennings

Date	Type	Reference	Original Amount	Balance Due	Payment
05/08/2023	Bill	473944	4,970.00	4,970.00	4,970.00
			Check Amount		4,970.00

FSB-General Accoun

4,970.00

30001

WRIGHT, LINDSEY & JENNINGS LLP

200 West Capitol Avenue

Suite 2300

Little Rock, AR 72201

501-371-0808

Patricia Hector, Library Director  
Saline County Library  
1800 Smithers Dr.  
Benton, AR 72015

Invoice Number 473944  
Invoice Date 05/08/23  
Client Number 025514  
Matter Number 0081741

Re: Formation of the proposed Saline Garland Library System

Total for Professional Services	\$9,940.00
<b>Garland County Total Amount Due</b>	<b>\$4,970.00</b>
<b>Saline County Total Amount Due</b>	<b>\$4,970.00</b>
Total Current Charges	\$9,940.00

By: PH APPROVED Date: 5/17/23  
By: WJW PAID Date: 17 May 23

---

Payment is due in full upon receipt of this invoice.  
Please enclose remittance copy with payment.  
Employer Identification No. 71-0239196

WRIGHT, LINDSEY & JENNINGS LLP  
200 West Capitol Avenue  
Suite 2300  
Little Rock, AR 72201  
501-371-0808

Patricia Hector, Library Director  
Saline County Library  
1800 Smithers Dr.  
Benton, AR 72015

Invoice Number 473944  
Invoice Date 05/08/23  
Client Number 025514  
Matter Number 0081741

Re: Formation of the proposed Saline Garland Library System

Total for Professional Services	\$9,940.00
<b>Garland County Total Amount Due</b>	<b>\$4,970.00</b>
<b>Saline County Total Amount Due</b>	<b>\$4,970.00</b>
Total Current Charges	\$9,940.00

Payment is due in full upon receipt of this invoice.  
Please enclose remittance copy with payment.  
Employer Identification No. 71-0239196

WRIGHT, LINDSEY & JENNINGS LLP

200 West Capitol Avenue  
Suite 2300  
Little Rock, AR 72201  
501-371-0808

Patricia Hector, Library Director  
Saline County Library  
1800 Smithers Dr.  
Benton, AR 72015

Invoice Number 473944  
Invoice Date 05/08/23  
Client Number 025514  
Matter Number 0081741

Re: Formation of the proposed Saline Garland Library System

**For Professional Services Incurred Through 04/30/23:**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>		<b>Hours</b>
07/06/22	Spivey III, John William	Prepare response to email from Ms. Hector	0.30
07/07/22	Spivey III, John William	Prepare Application for Incorporation; Interlocal Agreement and Ordinance approving the Interlocal Agreement	1.50
07/13/22	Spivey III, John William	Review email from Ms. Hector re: response to question	0.20
07/18/22	Spivey III, John William	Review and respond to email from Mr. Webb re: Agreements	0.20
07/22/22	Spivey III, John William	Review and editing Ordinance; Application and Interlocal Agreement	1.20
07/22/22	Spivey III, John William	Prepare email with documents to client for review	0.20
07/26/22	Spivey III, John William	Attend meeting with Mr. Webb and Ms. Hector re: Saline Garland Library System	1.20
07/26/22	Spivey III, John William	Prepare for meeting to discuss Interlocal Agreement	0.20
07/26/22	Spivey III, John William	Review Application and Agreement	0.20
07/27/22	Spivey III, John William	Telephone conference with Ms. Hector re: organizational documents	0.20
07/27/22	Spivey III, John William	Review and revise Interlocal Agreement and other drafts	1.60
07/27/22	Spivey III, John William	Review emails from Ms. Hector re: CAMALS documents	0.20
07/27/22	Spivey III, John William	Prepare email to Mr. Webb and Ms. Hector re: regional library code and Interlocal Agreement	0.20
07/27/22	Spivey III, John William	Review email from Mr. Webb	0.10
07/28/22	Spivey III, John William	Review and revise Application; Agreement and Ordinance	1.50

025514 Garland County, Arkansas  
0081741 Formation of the proposed Saline Garland Library System

Invoice 473944  
Page 3

<b>Date</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>		<b>Hours</b>
07/28/22	Spivey III, John William	Prepare email to Mr. Webb and Ms. Hector	0.10
07/29/22	Spivey III, John William	Review revised draft documents and send to clients	0.30
08/02/22	Spivey III, John William	Review and respond to emails from Mr. Gruber, Saline County Attorney re: documents	0.20
08/02/22	Spivey III, John William	Telephone conference with Mr. Gruder re: documents	0.40
08/02/22	Spivey III, John William	Review email from Mr. Webb and response	0.20
08/03/22	Spivey III, John William	Teleconference with Mr. Webb re: documents	0.20
08/03/22	Spivey III, John William	Review Interlocal Cooperation Act	0.60
08/03/22	Spivey III, John William	Review and review organizational documents	1.00
08/05/22	Spivey III, John William	Review revised drafts of Application, Agreement and Ordinances	0.60
08/05/22	Lantz, Dee Dee	Telephone conferences with Arkansas Secretary of State and State Library Office regarding reservation of name	0.50
08/08/22	Spivey III, John William	Confer with Ms. Elliott re: name reservation	0.20
08/08/22	Spivey III, John William	Review revised documents and confer with Ms. Hutchins	0.30
08/08/22	Elliott, Astrid C.	Confer with Dee Dee Lantz and Jamie Hutchins regarding name reservation; telephone conference with Bill Spivey regarding name reservation; review statue and prepare email correspondence with Arkansas Secretary of State regarding name reservation and application	1.00
08/09/22	Spivey III, John William	Review and respond to email from Mr. Webb re: APERS	0.20
08/10/22	Spivey III, John William	Confer with Mr. Webb and Ms. Hector re: APERS and documents	0.50
08/11/22	Spivey III, John William	Review Agreement, Application and Ordinances	1.00
08/12/22	Spivey III, John William	Review changes to Agreement and Application	0.20
08/12/22	Spivey III, John William	Prepare email with revised documents to Mr. Gruber, Ms. Hector, Mr. Howard and Mr. Webb	0.20
08/15/22	Spivey III, John William	Review and respond to emails from Ms. Hector and Mr. Webb re: revisions to documents	0.20
08/17/22	Spivey III, John William	Review and respond to email from Mr. Webb re: APERS	0.20
08/22/22	Spivey III, John William	Review and respond to Mr. Webb re: APERS	0.20
08/23/22	Spivey III, John William	Review and respond to emails re: APERS conference call	0.20

025514 Garland County, Arkansas  
0081741 Formation of the proposed Saline Garland Library System

Invoice 473944  
Page 4

<b>Date</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>		<b>Hours</b>
08/23/22	Spivey III, John William	Review email from Mr. Gruber	0.10
08/24/22	Spivey III, John William	Teleconference with Mr. Gruber re: document comments	0.20
08/24/22	Spivey III, John William	Review and reformat documents and resend to all parties	0.20
08/30/22	Spivey III, John William	Review responses from Mr. Gruber and Mr. Webb	0.10
09/01/22	Spivey III, John William	Teleconference with Mr. Gruber	0.20
09/01/22	Spivey III, John William	Review Interlocal Agreement for Regional Library	0.20
09/01/22	Spivey III, John William	Review email from Ms. Hector and Mr. Webb	0.20
09/01/22	Spivey III, John William	Telephone conference with Mr. Webb, Ms. Hector and APERS and Regional Library Agreement	0.50
09/01/22	Spivey III, John William	Teleconference with Ms. Gilson, Chief Counsel at APERS	0.50
09/01/22	Spivey III, John William	Teleconference with Mr. Webb	0.20
09/06/22	Spivey III, John William	Review emails re: ZOOM call on Wednesday re: APERS	0.20
09/07/22	Spivey III, John William	ZOOM Conference with Ms. Hector and Mr. Webb re: APERS	0.50
09/07/22	Spivey III, John William	Review and respond to email from Mr. Webb	0.20
09/07/22	Spivey III, John William	Teleconference with Ms. Gilson at APERS	0.10
09/09/22	Spivey III, John William	Review emails from Mr. Webb and Ms. Hector and responses thereto	0.30
09/09/22	Spivey III, John William	Telephone conference with Ms. Hector re: APERS	0.50
09/09/22	Spivey III, John William	Telephone conference with Ms. Gilson at APERS	0.60
09/09/22	Spivey III, John William	Review emails from Mr. Webb and Ms. Hector and prepare response	0.30
09/09/22	Spivey III, John William	Prepare report re: conversation with Ms. Gilson	0.20
09/12/22	Spivey III, John William	Teleconference with Mr. Webb re: legislation	0.20
09/15/22	Spivey III, John William	Review and respond to multiple emails from Ms. Hector re: insurance	0.30
09/16/22	Spivey III, John William	Teleconference with Mr. Gruber	0.30
09/16/22	Spivey III, John William	Review and respond to emails from Ms. Hector re: health insurance	0.20

025514 Garland County, Arkansas  
 0081741 Formation of the proposed Saline Garland Library System

Invoice 473944  
 Page 5

Date	Timekeeper		Hours
09/17/22	Spivey III, John William	Telephone conference with Mr. Webb	0.20
09/19/22	Spivey III, John William	Review emails from Mr. Webb and Ms. Hector re: Health Insurance	0.20
09/19/22	Spivey III, John William	Review email exchange between Ms. George and Mr. Webb re: APERS membership	0.20
09/20/22	Spivey III, John William	Review email and letter from Judge Arey and forward to Ms. Hector	0.20
10/18/22	Spivey III, John William	Review and respond to email from Mr. Webb re: proposed legislation	0.10
10/19/22	Spivey III, John William	Review application and agreement re: statutory consistency	0.20
11/15/22	Spivey III, John William	Review email from Mr. Webb re: APERS	0.10
11/28/22	Spivey III, John William	Review and respond to emails from Mr. Webb re: APERS membership	0.20
11/29/22	Spivey III, John William	Review email from Mr. Webb to Mr. Les Warren re: APERS	0.20
12/02/22	Spivey III, John William	Review emails from Mr. Webb and Ms. Hector and response thereto	0.20
02/14/23	Spivey III, John William	Review and respond to emails from Mr. Adam Webb	0.20
04/05/23	Spivey III, John William	Review email from Ms. Hector re failure of legislature re APERS	0.10
<b>Total Hours</b>			<b>25.90</b>

**Timekeeper Time Summary**

Timekeeper	Hours		Rate	Value
John W. Spivey III	24.10	at	\$400.00 =	9,640.00
John W. Spivey III	0.30	at	\$400.00 =	120.00
Astrid C. Elliott	1.00	at	\$120.00 =	120.00
Dee D. Lantz	0.50	at	\$120.00 =	60.00
<b>Current Fees</b>				<b>\$9,940.00</b>
<b>Total Current Charges</b>				<b>\$9,940.00</b>